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Community
One of this generation's greatest needs is a strong community. The
world offers a cheap substitute for God’s plan for community. In this
four-week study on the early church, we look at four pillars of Christian
community that will give students the God-honoring community they
are hungry for!

Less is More
We all struggle to feel like we have enough when the reality is that less
is often more! Through the story of Gideon, this four-week series
examines how God is more than enough in every area of our lives!

Spooked
Fear feels like an unavoidable part of our lives, yet scripture commands
us not to be afraid. How do we conquer fear as believers? This four-
week series looks at fear in the life of Peter in his relationship with
Jesus, showing the dangers of fear but also the hope we find in Christ!

AUGUST 4 WEEKS

SEPTEMBER 4 WEEKS

OCTOBER 4 WEEKS
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Try Me
Our culture is consumed by greed and the love of money, which
Scripture calls the root of all evil! God’s antidote for the poison of greed
is generosity. Through a study of Scripture, this four-week series will
teach us how to be generous with our tithe, time, talents, and treasure! 

Christmas POV
We’ve all heard the Christmas story each year. This December, we will
look at the birth of Jesus from three unique perspectives. This three-
week series illustrates the same story from three viewpoints we may
not often consider as we celebrate the birth of Jesus!

The Future is Bright
Our students need a hope they can hold on to. In this series, we'll look
through the Scriptures to see that God has a plan for our lives, will
provide for us, and is a living hope we can hold on to. Students will
learn to walk in truth and believe that despite their circumstances, the
future is bright. 

NOVEMBER 4 WEEKS

DECEMBER 3 WEEKS

JANUARY 3 WEEKS
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Red Flags
Dating relationships can be complicated and even stressful at times.
How do you know who the right person is and what to avoid in dating?
In this four-week relationship series, we’ll look to Scripture to see the
clear red flags that we all need to avoid in our dating lives! 

Long Story Short
The story of Scripture shapes our worldview when we understand it
wholly. When we understand God’s plan from beginning to end, it
shapes how we live day to day. This four-week series is a walkthrough
of Scripture at a 30,000-foot view through creation, the fall,
redemption, and future restoration. 

As It Was
Because of Jesus, nothing is the same as it was! We celebrate the
Easter season with this four-week series on Jesus. Through His death
on the cross, what used to be is no longer. From death to life, slavery to
freedom, spiritual blindness to revelation, sinners to saints — nothing is
the same with Jesus! 

FEBRUARY 4 WEEKS

MARCH 4 WEEKS

APRIL 4 WEEKS
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Bones
Ezekiel’s vision of the Valley of Dry Bones in Ezekiel 37 is a powerful
moment in the Old Testament that teaches us about the heart of God.
This three-week exegetical series discusses the truths of prophecy and
revival through Ezekiel’s vision of the Valley of Dry Bones.

If You Can't Take the Heat
“If you can’t take the heat, get out of the kitchen!” When the fires of life
heat up, followers of Jesus don’t quit—we stand firm with bold faith,
trusting Jesus! This four-week series explores four stories of bold faith
from people who trusted God even under pressure!

Sorry, Not Sorry
In a world of skepticism and post-modern culture, students are
desperate for answers to the hard questions about their faith. Things
like: “Is God real?”, “How do I know that the Bible is accurate?” or “How
do I defend my faith to others?” In this series on apologetics, we tackle
some of the big questions to help students learn how to understand and
defend their faith well.

MAY 3 WEEKS

JUNE 4 WEEKS

JULY 5 WEEKS


